michele@abcs.co
m

From: Anthony Ammann <ammannautotransport@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 6:54 AM

To: Charles Wiegand; michele@abcs.co

Subject: Fwd: Payment

2nd request to forward info. They have not received info yet.
Tony

---------- Forwarded message ----—--—-

From: Echo Palmer <echo@mseedfinancial.com>

Date: Mon, Feb 14, 2022 at 5:43 AM

Subject: Payment

To: 2088669253 @vzwpix.com <2088669253 @vzwpix.com>
CC: Anthony Ammann <ammannautotransport@gmail.com>

Good morning Anthony - regarding your payments. Your final
payment was in January and you will not have another
payment until renewal April 9t In the mean time can you
please get me over your last 4 quarters of IFTA’s and let me
Rnow also if you would like to amend any values. You should
have received an email form Jacob Cunningham requesting
this information also.

Please let me know if you need anything else.

Thank you,

b

Senior Transportation Account Executive/Notary

IRH&D@‘FM@@@E@ Mustard Seed Truck insurance

TRUCK INSURANCE



208.577.5577 I 208.658.1376 D: 208.629.0628

208.516.3173

501 5. Main Street, Meridian, ID 83642

https://www.mseedfinancial.com/

echo@mseedfinancial.com

Certs: certs@mseedfinancial.com

**PLEASE NOTE THAT ALL POLICY CHANGE MUST BE IN
REQUESTED IN WRITING TO PROCESS**

We accept EFS checks, T-Checks, ComChecks, and Credit Card payments!
We now offer Group Health policies for your business! Ask me about a quote!

ALSO PLEASE ASK ME ABOUT OUR FACTORING PROGRAMS!

THIS EMAIL AND ANY FILES TRANSMITTED WITH IT ARE CONFIDENTIAL AND ARE INTENDED SOLELY FOR THE USE OF THE INDIVIDUAL OR ENTITY TO
WHOM THEY ARE ADDRESSED. If you are not the intended recipient or the person responsible for delivering the email to the intended recipient, be
advised that you have received this email in error and that any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this email is strictly prohibited.
Any inadvertent receipt by you of confidential information shall not constitute a waiver of confidentiality. The sender disclaims liability for error or
omissions in the content of this message that arise as a result of email transmission. If you have received this email in error, please return immediately
to the sender and delete this copy from your system. Thank you for your cooperation,

From: 2088669253 @vzwpix.com <20886692 53 @vzwpix.com>
Sent: Sunday, February 13, 2022 11:34 AM

To: Echo Palmer <echo@mseedfinancial.com>

Subject:




