Washington State Department of Revenue

Your request has been submitted and your confirmation number is 0-028-537-794

Below is information from your application
Filing Date and Time 8/26/2022 12:00:28 PM

Legal Entity Name  BAILEY & SON LLC
UBI 604-923-830
Payment Method ACH Debit/E-Check
Payment Amount  $24.00

We will process your business application within the next 10 business days. If city or state
endorsements were applied for, allow approximately 3 additional weeks to receive the
business license due to approval time.

To check the status of your application, click Manage My Profile, then select View, Edit, or
Print Drafts or Submissions in the Drafts and Submissions area.

For information on business resources, education, and workshops, go to
dor.wa.gov/nextsteps.



Thank you for filing online

STATE OF WASHINGTON
BUSINESS LICENSING SERVICE

Our processing time generally takes up to 10 business days. Some endorsements may take more time for state or city
approval. You will receive your business license with approved endorsements in the mail. An updated business license
will be mailed to you when additional endorsements are approved,

Confirmation Number: (-028-537-794

Payment Method: ACH Debit/E-Check
Business Entity Information

Entity Type: Limited Liability Company
Name of Entity: BAILEY & SONLLC
Account ID: 604923830-001-0001
Firm Name: BAILEY & SON LLC
Trade Names Added

BAILEY GENERAL CONTRACTING LLC

Fee Type Begin
BLS Processing Fee 08/26/2022
Trade Name Registration 08/26/2022

L0004

Filing Date and Time: 08/26/2022 12:00:28 PM

End Count

Fee

$19.00
$5.00

Grand Total:

$24.00

$24.00



michele@abcs.co

m

From: Matthew Bailey <baileyandson1974@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, August 26, 2022 10:14 AM

To: Michele McKerrihan

Subject: Re: LLC

Bank wants to know if we are same llc and if 'm just doing business as Bailey general contracting. That would be handy. |
keep same account and not pay for another llc. Seems like that’s what you're doing. But remember I'm kinda ignorant

On Fri, Aug 26, 2022 at 8:00 AM Matthew Bailey <baileyandson1974@gmail.com> wrote:
Sorry | am ignorant to the process. Last time | did this was 8-9 years ago.

On Fri, Aug 26, 2022 at 7:57 AM Matthew Bailey <bailevandson1974@gmail.com> wrote:
Did you change the name?

On Fri, Aug 26, 2022 at 7:56 AM Michele McKerrihan <michele@abcs.co> wrote:
It should be to them by now. I don’t see any reason for this to slow you down. The sos and dor have you as the only
owner.

Michele

On Aug 26, 2022, at 6:10 AM, Matthew Bailey <baileyandson1974@gmail.com> wrote:

So L&l should have that on file? So I'm good to go?

On Thu, Aug 25, 2022 at 10:47 PM Michele McKerrihan <michele@abcs.co> wrote: .
Yes. | checked the license and sos today and they were changed. i
A single partner llc is reported on you personal tax return just to let you know. So only one federal
return is needed. A 1040

Michele

> 0On Aug 25, 2022, at 6:08 PM, Matthew Bailey <baileyandson1974@gmail.com> wrote:
>

-
> Hi .l should have alf of my insurance stuff tomorrow. Is the LLC stuff ready from the state?



